
These boards promise to be a 
unique way to win bragging 
rights among your peers!
Whether you prefer a simple 
logo display or a fully 
customized design, we offer 
solutions to fit your needs.
All designs will be printed on 
vinyl and attached to your 
boards.  This is a design 
service only. The boards are 
an additional cost.

Design your 
Corn Hole 
board for the 
upcoming 
AIA Connecti-
cut Corn Hole 
Tourament

Option 1: 
Logo Only/One Color 
Background
Opt for a sleek, professional 
look with your logo prominently 
displayed. This minimalist 
approach guarantees brand 
recognition while maintaining a 
classic, elegant board design.

Option 2: 
Logo and Racing Stripes
Elevate your board with dynamic 
racing stripes along with your 
logo. This option adds a sporty 
edge, drawing more eyes and 
creating a vibrant, energetic 
presence.

Option 3: 
Fully Designed
Unleash creativity with fully 
customized boards. From 
concept to completion, you can 
design a unique masterpiece 
on your own or have our 
designer do one that perfectly 
encapsulates your company’s 
essence and message.

Corn Hole 
Board Designs!

$225 $275 $350


